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Holistic Education In An
Environment Most Congenial And
Innovating, Where Virtue Is The

Strongest Shield.

Providing Our Best In
Education, For As Many As

We Can.

Virtue Is The Strongest Shield.



HIGHLIGHTS



SCIENCE
ASSEMBLY

On 10th October 2024, as part
of the Science Week

celebration, The Science
department of Central School

Dubai organized a science
assembly aimed at fostering

interest in scientific
advancements and recognizing

student achievements. 
The event concluded with an
award ceremony where HOS
Ms. Nima Pradeep facilitated
participants of the Science

Week Expo and Science
Corner, acknowledging their
efforts and celebrating the

winners of the NIMS Science
Expo.  The program was met

with enthusiasm and
successfully achieved its goal

of sparking curiosity and
encouraging a passion for

science.



GANDHI JAYANTI
ASSEMBLY

The assembly provided an
opportunity for students to

reflect on Mahatma
Gandhi's core principles of
truth (Satyagraha), non-

violence (Ahimsa), and
selfless service. Through

speeches, multiple
orations, and a quiz,

students gained a deeper
understanding of how these
values played a crucial role
in India's freedom struggle

and how they can be
applied in their daily lives.

The Principal addressed the
gathering, distributed

awards and certificates to
students who participated
in the Climate Conference,
and congratulated them on

their achievements.



THEMATIC ASSEMBLY
World food day assembly was
conducted on October 16th
2024 from 1.00pm -1:40 pm

in the Auditorium. During the
World Food Day assembly,

students conducted a quiz on
food security and delivered a
speech on the importance of

food and sustainable
practices. These activities

raised awareness about global
hunger and responsible
consumption. A special

highlight of the event was the
unveiling of Ms. Prathiba first

book cover page. The
assembly successfully

engaged the school
community in important
discussions about food

conservation and global food
issues.



Kindness Activity

“Kindness is a language
which the deaf can hear and

the blind can see.”
— Mark Twain
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