
 
 
 

Annual Report 2024-2025 
 
“The only person who is educated is the one who has learned how to learn and 
change.'' - Carl Rogers  
At The Central School, Dubai, we believe in nurturing young minds through an enriching 
academic experience that fosters critical thinking, creativity, and holistic development. 
Our commitment is to empower students to realize their full potential and equip them 
with the skills and confidence to face the future with determination and resilience. 
We extend our heartfelt gratitude to our founder, whose visionary leadership has laid the 
foundation for the success we celebrate today. Our school, built on the core values of 
PRESIDE—Perseverance, Responsibility, Excellence, Spirituality, Innovation, 
Dedication, and Empathy—continues to thrive because of the collective efforts of our 
students, teachers, and parents. 
This year has been a testament to our collective dedication and perseverance. From 
academic excellence to extracurricular achievements, our students have continued to 
shine in all spheres, setting new benchmarks for success. Guided by our core values 
and an unwavering commitment to quality education, we have embraced challenges 
and transformed them into opportunities for growth. 
 
We take immense pride in celebrating the accomplishments of our students, teachers, 
and the entire school community. Their relentless efforts and passion for learning have 
made this academic year remarkable. With great pride, we reflect on the achievements 
of our students from Grades 10 and 12 in the academic session 2023-2024. 
 

 
Toppers in 12th Grade AISSCE - March -2023 

GRADE XII SCHOOL TOPPERS 

Stream Name of the student Position Percentage Mark 

SCIENCE KADER FATHIMA SHEIK SYED ALI FIRST 95.6 478 

SCIENCE ABDUL SAMAD VASEEM SECOND 95 475 

COMMERCE FATEMA SHAIK THIRD 93 465 

 

 
 
 
 

   

 



SCIENCE STREAMWISE TOPPERS – BOYS 

Stream Name of the student Position Percentage Mark 

SCIENCE ABDUL SAMAD VASEEM FIRST 95 475 

SCIENCE SYED MUNEERUDDIN SECOND 92.2 461 

SCIENCE MOHAMED SHOHAIL SHAHUL THIRD 91.6 458 

     

COMMERCE STREAM WISE TOPPERS – BOYS 

Stream Name of the student Position Percentage Mark 

COMMERCE MOHAMMED KASHIF NANGARATH FIRST 85 425 

COMMERCE FARHAN KHAN SECOND 80.4 402 

COMMERCE MOHAMED LAFRAN THIRD 80.2 401 

     

VOCATIONAL STREAMWISE TOPPERS – BOYS 

Stream Name of the student Position Percentage Mark 

VOCATIONAL VIJAY PRAGADEESH FIRST 80.8 404 

VOCATIONAL ISMAIL SECOND 79 395 

VOCATIONAL ABDUL RAHMAN ABRAR THIRD 78.8 394 

VOCATIONAL IMRAN ISHAQ THIRD 78.8 394 

     

SCIENCE STREAMWISE TOPPERS – GIRLS 

Stream Name of the student Position Percentage Mark 

SCIENCE KADER FATHIMA SHEIK SYED ALI FIRST 95.6 478 

SCIENCE FIYA KISHKAR SECOND 89.2 446 

SCIENCE FAHMIDHA JANNAT CHOWDHURY THIRD 87.4 437 

     

COMMERCE STREAMWISE TOPPERS – GIRLS 

Stream Name of the student Position Percentage Mark 

COMMERCE FATEMA SHAIK FIRST 93 465 

COMMERCE ADINA BANGESH KALEEM KHAN SECOND 90 450 

COMMERCE REHNA MOHAMED ALI THIRD 88.6 443 

     

 
 
 
 

 



 
Toppers of 10th Grade AISSE - March -2023 

 
GRADE X SCHOOL TOPPERS 

 

Sl.No. Name of the student Position Percentage Mark 

1 HAFSA MUHAMMED NISHAB FIRST 96 480 

2 HAMDAN ADIL N SECOND 95.8 479 

3 RAYAN AHMED THIRD 94.6 473 

   
 
 
 

 

TOPPERS (BOYS) 

Sl.No. Name of the student Position Percentage Mark 

1 M HAMDAN ADIL N FIRST 95.8 479 

2 M RAYAN AHMED SECOND 94.6 473 

3 M AARIZ AHMED THIRD 92.8 464 

   
 
 
 

 

TOPPERS (BOYS) 

Sl.No. Name of the student Position Percentage Mark 

1 F HAFSA MUHAMMED NISHAB FIRST 96 480 

2 F AYSHA AFRA K SECOND 94.4 472 

3 F NANDIKA VINODH THIRD 93.6 468 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



 
                                                                     

ASSET 
 

ASSET Phase-wise Analysis - 2023-2024 

English 

Phase 
Stanine 5 and above % Stanine 6 and above % 

Boys Girls Combined Boys Girls Combined 

Phase 2 66.46 78.55 72.51 42.29 54.08 48.18 

Phase 3 65.16 83.07 74.12 42.93 55.26 49.09 

Phase 4 50.00 66.67 58.33 29.55 31.67 30.61 

 
 
 

ASSET Phase-wise Analysis - 2023-2024 

Mathematics 

Phase 
Stanine 5 and above % Stanine 6 and above % 

Boys Girls Combined Boys Girls Combined 

Phase 2 84.07 81.58 82.82 65.86 58.20 62.03 

Phase 3 81.28 67.66 74.47 59.22 35.38 47.30 

Phase 4 71.76 49.57 60.67 47.06 20.51 33.79 

 
 
 

ASSET Phase-wise Analysis - 2023-2024 

Science 

Phase 
Stanine 5 and above % Stanine 6 and above % 

Boys Girls Combined Boys Girls Combined 

Phase 2 67.72 69.47 68.59 47.13 50.16 48.64 

Phase 3 59.04 61.15 60.09 34.58 37.72 36.15 

Phase 4 68.97 45.00 56.98 35.63 25.00 30.32 

 
 

 



PISA 

 
 

PISA  2025 Targets 
PISA Domains Mathematics Science Reading 

PISA 2022 Scores 449 443 437 

 PISA 2025 Targets 484 478 472 

                                                                                                                      

PIRLS 2026 Targets 

School Score 2021 500 

PIRLS 2026 Target Score 530 

  

 

TIMSS Targets 

2023 Performance 

against set targets 

Grade 4 Grade 8 

Mathematics Science Mathematics Science 

 TIMSS 2023 Scores 509 520 510 515 

TIMSS 2027 Target Range 529 - 534 535 - 540 530-535 530-535 

 

 



CAT 4 ANALYSIS  

 

Phase 

Percentage of students scoring 

stanine 5 and above 

Verbal Non Verbal Quantitative Spatial 

Phase 2 44.64 44.15 44.41 38.49 

Phase 3 38.10 44.65 26.21 39.98 

Phase 4 37.10 45.15 32.93 44.51 

 
 
 

Phase 

Percentage of Students Scoring 

stanine 6 and above 

Verbal Non Verbal Quantitative Spatial 

Phase 2 31.05 28.72 29.61 25.00 

Phase 3 22.93 30.38 15.11 25.81 

Phase 4 23.66 32.52 18.90 30.49 

 
 Achievements in Interschool Competitions  

 
Our school has actively participated in various interschool competitions, showcasing the 
talent and dedication of our students. We have proudly won numerous accolades and 
prizes with consistent effort and teamwork, reflecting our commitment to excellence and 
holistic development. These achievements have inspired us to strive for even greater 
success in the future. 
 

Event  Position  Venue 

Central Islamic Festival Overall Champion  The Central School 

Islamic Fest Overall Champion  JSS International School 

Under - 14 Volleyball  First Position In UAE CBSE cluster meet 
 

 



School Activities 
 
This year, we had the privilege of organizing a wide array of exciting and impactful 
activities that contributed to the holistic development of our students. These activities 
were designed to nurture perseverance, resilience, creativity, and teamwork, all of which 
are essential for shaping well-rounded individuals. Highlights of the year included the 
Green Legacy initiative, the Climate Conference, and Entrepreneurship Day, which 
encouraged students to collaborate and boosted their financial literacy. 
 
Our Science Week was a particular highlight, with activities like Science Charades, 
which helped students develop their scientific vocabulary enjoyably and interactively 
 
. During Math Week, we organized a thrilling Treasure Hunt and a Sudoku competition 
to foster problem-solving skills among students. 
 
On Children’s Day, we hosted a Talent Hunt to showcase the hidden talents of our 
students, and Teacher’s Day was celebrated with great enthusiasm through a vibrant 
series of events presented by our student council. 
 
In line with our commitment to promoting cultural awareness, we embraced 
multi-cultural celebrations such as Onam, Eid, Pongal, and Diwali. These events helped 
enrich our students' understanding of India’s diverse cultural heritage. 
 
Our graduating students were actively engaged in career counseling workshops and 
fairs, which provided valuable insights into potential career paths. 
 
Additionally, our students demonstrated their commitment to social responsibility by 
participating in various community activities, including volunteering projects, charity 
drives, and the SMILE refrigerator initiative, among others. 
 
These events and activities have played a significant role in the overall growth and 
development of our students, and we are excited to continue fostering such 
opportunities in the years to come. 
 
 
 
 

 
 

 



Gratitude 
 

As we reflect on another successful year at The Central School, we would like to 
express our profound gratitude to everyone who has been part of our journey. Our 
sincere thanks go out to the passionate staff, dedicated teachers, hardworking students, 
and supportive parents, whose commitment and collaboration have made this year 
memorable. Your unwavering dedication to fostering a culture of learning, growth, and 
kindness has been at the heart of our accomplishments. 
 
We are deeply grateful for the trust, encouragement, and partnership we receive from 
our wider community, which continually inspires us to reach new heights in education. 
Together, we have built an environment where every student thrives. 
 
With great anticipation, we look forward to the upcoming year, eager to continue our 
collective progress and to offer even more opportunities for our students to excel and 
grow. 

 


